
“Albert Einstein 
said blind 
obedience to 
authority is the 
greatest enemy 
of truth. 
Science can 
flourish only in 
an atmosphere 
of free speech. 
The Hegelian 
dialectic is a 3 
step process of 
bringing 
change. This 
technique is as 



old as politics 
itself.
   First step(thesis) Is to 
create a problem. Second 
step (antithesis) Is to 
generate opposition to the 
problem (fear,panic and 
hysteria). Third step 
(synthesis) is to offer the 
solution to the problem 
created by the first step. A 
change which would have 
been impossible to impose 
upon the people without 
the proper psychological 
conditioning achieved in 
step one and two. Why is it 
important for you to 
understand the subject of 
Hegelian dialectic? 
Because it is the process 
by which change is Being 



accomplished in society 
today. More importantly it 
is the tool that the global 
elite Are utilizing to 
manipulate the minds of 
the average citizen to 
except that change, where 
ordinarily They would 
refuse it. The Hegelian 
dialectic is, in short, the 
critical process by which 
the ruling elite create a 
problem, anticipating in 
advance the reaction the 
population will have to the 
given crisis, therefore 
conditioning the people 
that a change is needed. 
When the population is 
properly conditioned, The 
desired agenda of the 
ruling elite is presented as 
the solution. The solution 



isn’t intended to solve the 
problem, but rather to 
serve as the basis for a 
new problem or Escalade 
the existing one. When the 
newly created problem 
reaches the boiling point 
of crisis, it becomes the 
foundation upon which 
arguments May again be 
made for change. The 
process is repeated over 
and over moving society 
towards whatever end   
The planners have in mind. 
70% of the budget for the 
media conglomerates 
comes from 
pharmaceutical 
companies. Sema4 
announced there fourth 
quarter revenue which is 
significantly above what 



was expected. Sema4 is 
partially owned by 
Governor Ned Lamont’s 
family, the state awarded 
26 million no bid contract. 
Governor Lamont has yet 
to disclose his family’s 
profit in this investment. 
How much did his 
executive orders play a 
role in their annual 
growth? How is this not 
illegal? How can anyone 
take him an his mandates 
seriously? An why are we 
seriously considering 
granting a 7th executive 
order? With the surge of 
data coming in about the 
inefficiency of the masks 
and vaccines Why is this 
still even up for debate? 
Enough using children as 



political pawns, Please end 
this tyranny before this 
escalates into something 
irreversible for the future 
generations. 


